Lockington Parish Council Meeting Agenda Monday 17th June 2024

Dear Sir/Madam,

I hereby give you notice that an ordinary meeting of Lockington Parish Council will take place on **Monday 17th June 2024 @ 7pm.**

All members of the Parish Council are hereby summoned to attend, for the purpose of transacting the agenda items listed below:

All members of the public and press are welcome to attend and may make representation to the Parish Council in the Public Participation Period, which will be towards the end of the meeting.

Agenda Items (Subject to amendment)

24-25/11 To receive Apologies:

24-25/12 (a) To approve the minutes of the Annual Parish Meeting that took place on the 20th of May 2024.

24-25/12 (b) To approve the minutes of the Annual Parish Council Meeting that took place on the 20th of May 2024.

24-25/12 (c) To approve the minutes of the Ordinary Parish Council meeting that took place on the 20th of May 2024.

<u>24-25/13 (a) To receive and record any 'Declaration of Interest' (Pecuniary, Non-Pecuniary and/or</u> <u>Prejudicial Interest</u>), by any member of the Parish Council in respect to the agenda items listed.

24-25/13 (b) To record the nature of Declaration of Interest identified 'a' above.

The Declaration of Interest should be made at the commencement of the meeting.

24-25/14 To review and resolve any East Riding of Yorkshire (ERYC) Council Business:

- 14.1 Yorkshire Water Feedback WWTP.
- 14.2 General ERYC Feedback from Ward Councillor.

24-25/15 Parish Council ongoing Business Matters:

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 15.1 Thorpe land sale/transfer update Heads of Terms/Solicitor/Land Registry.
- 15.2 Lockington/ERYC Highways Issues Spreadsheet review.
- 15.3 Consider Audit Review 23/24.
- 15.4 Speeding through Village.
- 15.5 Do It for East Yorkshire Community Grant.
- 15.6 Amen Field update.
- 15.7 Village Green update, forward plan and signage.

24-25/16 Correspondence/Clerk.

To review, debate and agree on an action plan for each of the following items;

- 16.1 Village Hall Funding Request for D Day Celebrations email dated 3.6.24.
- 16.2 The Local Government Boundary Commission for England email dated 6.6.24.
- 16.3 Beverley Community Event 30th June email dated 6.6.24.
- 16.4 Police and Crime Commissioner email dated 7.6.24.
- 16.5 ERNLLCA June 2024 Newsletter email dated 7.6.24.
- 16.6 Town and Parish Councils Joint Local Access Forum 19 June 2024 email dated 10.6.24.

<u> 24-25/17 Planning – All</u>

To review & submit observations for the following Planning Applications/Approvals

No planning applications.

24-25/18 Finances – Clerk

To review, debate and agree on financial items below;

- 18.1 Budget review to date.
- 18.2 Web Site Domains (LPC.com -19.7.2028) & (LPC.org.uk 19.7.2026) £100.08p
- 18.3 Warcup Construction (Village Green) £8498.40p.
- 18.4 Land Registry Plan preparation (Leonards) £48.
- 18.5 Land Valuation Thorpe (Leonards) £420.
- 18.6 Lock & Chain for Village Green £25.04p.

Agenda Monday 17th June 2024 Revision 1.3/Revision Date 10.6.24

24-25/9 Public Participation Period - Items for Next Agenda

24-25/20 Date of next Meeting

Ordinary Parish Council Meeting (OPCM) on Monday 15th July 2024 @ 1900 hrs in the Village Hall.

Issued by; Gareth Rees Clerk to Lockington Parish Council Mobile: 07768233352 E mail: lpcclerk@outlook.com